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‘ BIMBO FOOD, INC. MIDSTATE BAKERY DISTRIBUTERS, INC
SLICED BREAD
Whole
Grain
Rich or Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
BOCES 50% BOCES Product Total Vendor Vendor Price Product Total Vendor Vendor Price
Item Whole | Unitof | Estimated | Useable Code Vendor Vendor | Useable | Estimated | Vendor Price | per Useable Extended Bid Code Vendor Vendor | Useable | Estimated |Vendor Price| per Useable | Extended Bid
Number Item Description/Specification Grain | Measure | Quantities | Units Number | Product Brand Price  |Total Ozs. units Quantity per Oz. Unit Cost Number | Product Brand Price  |Total Ozs. units Quantity per Oz. Unit Cost
WHOLE WHEAT BREAD: sliced, 51% whole wheat or
1| 8405 |greater, 22 useable slices, 16 oz./loaf. X EA 34891 22 6053 FREIHOFER | $ 1.15 20 20 38,380 0.05750 $ 0.0575 | $ 2,006.23 13-319 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.23 24 28 27,414 0.0513' $ 0.0439 | $ 1,532.71
8410 100% FAMILY WHOLE WHEAT BREAD: sliced, 22
2 useable slices, 20 oz./loaf. X EA 19820 22 6053 FREIHOFER | $ 1.15 20 20 21,802 0.05750 $ 0.0575 | $ 1,139.65 13-322 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.58 24 24 18,168 0.0658 $ 0.0658 | $ 1,304.82
ITALIAN BREAD: Unseeded, sliced, 16 useable slices,
3| 8415|20 oz. loaf. EA 5371 16 6138135 FREIHOFER | $ 0.83 20 16 5,371 0.04150, $ 0.0519 | $ 278.62 12-252 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.00 20 16 5,371 0.0500 $ 0.0625 | $  335.69
8435 |TALIAN BREAD: Unseeded , Thick sliced, 11 useable
4 slices, 20 oz. loaf. EA 10 11 27/FREIHOFER | $ 1.10 22 17 6 0.05000, $ 0.0647 | $ 0.65 12-251 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.12 20 11 10 0.0560 $ 0.1018 | $ 1.02
8440 slices, 20-24 oz./loaf. Provide a product formulation
statement documenting the total weight of the whole
grain ingredients and the weight of the first ingredient if
the ingredient is not whole grain. Must be 51% or greater
5 whole grain. X EA 20596 20 3239 FREIHOFER | $ 1.10 24 22 18,724 0.04583 $ 0.0500 | $ 1,029.80 13-666 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.30 24 24 17,163 0.0542 $ 0.0542 | $ 1,115.62
12 GRAIN BREAD: 16 useable slices, 24 oz./loaf, 1g of
6| 8445 Dietary Fiber. X EA 1675 16 170 FREIHOFER | $ 1.35 24 14 1,914 0.05625/ $ 0.0964 | $ 161.52 12-339 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.67 22 16 1,675 0.0759 $ 0.1044 | $ 174.83
RYE BREAD: Traditional, sliced, plain, 20 useable slices, FREIHOFER
7| 8465 32 oz/loaf. X EA 744 20 6305 | (not WGR) 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 15-268 COHEN'S $ 250 32 22 676 0.0781 $ 0.1136 | $ 84.55
RYE BREAD: No Seed, sliced, 13 useable slices, 16 oz. FREIHOFER
8| 8470 loaf. X EA 10 13 6473 (not WGR) 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 14-500 COHEN'S $ 146 15 12 11 0.0973 $ 0.1217 | $ 1.22
9| 8495 RAISIN BREAD: sliced, 12 useable slices, 15-16 oz./loaf. EA 573 12 123 FREIHOFER | $ 1.85 16 14 491 0.11563/ $ 0.1321 | $ 75.72 12-310 BUTTERKRUST | $  1.89 15 14 491 0.1260 $ 0.1350 | $ 77.36
ROLLS
Whole
Grain
Rich or Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
BOCES 50% BOCES Product Total Vendor Vendor Price Product Total Vendor Vendor Price
Item Whole | Unitof | Estimated | Useable Code Vendor Vendor | Useable | Estimated | Vendor Price | per Useable Extended Bid Code Vendor Vendor | Useable | Estimated |Vendor Price| per Useable | Extended Bid
Number Item Description/Specification Grain | Measure | Quantities | Units Number | Product Brand Price  |Total Ozs.| units Quantity per Oz. Unit Cost Number | Product Brand Price  |Total Ozs.| units Quantity per Oz. Unit Cost
HOT DOG ROLL WHOLE GRAIN WHITE: 19 oz., 12 ct.
10| 8505|1.5 ozs roll. X Dz 6485 12 5196 FREIHOFER | $ 1.2750 28 12 6,485 0.04554| $ 0.1063 | $ 689.03 13-560 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.92 19 12 6,485 0.1011 $ 0.1600 | $ 1,037.60
DINNER ROLL: WHOLE GRAIN, Breakaway 14 oz., 12
11| 8510/|count. X Dz 7500 12 7268 FREIHOFER | $ 1.10 14 12 7,500 0.07857| $ 0.0917 | $ 687.50 13-2707 |BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.67 18 16 5,625 0.0928 $ 0.1044 | $ 782.81
HAMBURG ROLL: MULTIGRAIN, 19 oz., dozen. 2g of
12| 8545 Dietary Fiber. X Dz 3995 12 3242 FREIHOFER | $ 1.30 24 12 3,995 0.05417 ' $ 0.1083 | $ 432.79 13-795 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.54 19 12 3,995 0.0811/ $ 0.1283 | $ 512.69
WHOLE GRAIN 4" KAISER ROLL: sliced, 24 oz., 12
13| 8570 |count. X Dz 6311 12 3242 FREIHOFER | $ 1.30 24 12 6,311 0.05417| $ 0.1083 | $ 683.69 27-666 PETRILLO'S $ 210 24 12 6,311 0.0875' $ 0.1750 | $ 1,104.43
8575/HAMBURGER ROLL: WHOLE WHEAT, 54 oz., 30
count. 3g of Dietary Fiber. Provide a product formulation
statement documenting the total weight of the whole
grain ingredients and the weight of the first ingredient if
the first ingredient is not whole grain. Must be 51% or
14 greater whole grain. X PK 24386 30 5198 FREIHOFER | $ 3.1875 56.10 30 24,386 0.05682 $ 0.1063 | $ 2,591.01 13-639 BUTTERKRUST | $ 4.54 54 30 24,386 0.0841 $ 0.1513 | $ 3,690.41
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WHEAT HAMBURGER ROLL: 19 oz. 8 pack, 1.5 oz per
15/ 8580]roll. X PK 9233 8 5198 FREIHOFER | $ 0.85 15 8 9,233 0.05667| $ 0.1063 | $ 981.01 13-795 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.54 19 12 6,155 0.0811 $ 0.1283 | $ 1,184.90
8595 WHOLE WHEAT HOT DOG ROLL: dozen, 1.75 oz/roll
max. Provide a product formulation statement
documenting the total weight of the whole grain
ingredients and the weight of the first ingredient if the first
16 ingredient is not whole grain. X Dz 17794 12 5196 FREIHOFER | $ 1.2750 21 12 17,794 0.06071 $ 0.1063 | $ 1,890.61 13-560 BUTTERKRUST | $ 1.92 19 12 17,794 0.1011 $ 0.1600 | $ 2,847.04
WHEAT SUBMARINE/ITALIAN ROLL: 6", 6/pack, 2
17| 8640 oz/roll. X PK 7535 6 2649 FREIHOFER | $ 1.45 16 6 7,535 0.09063| $ 0.2417 | $ 1,820.96 13-1003 |BUTTERKRUST |$  2.02 13 6 7,535 0.1554 $ 0.3367 | $ 2,536.78
WHOLE GRAIN THIN ITALIAN SUB ROLLS: 8/pkg.,
17| 8670|120z. X PK 3,775 8 NO BID 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 13-1003 |BUTTERKRUST |$  2.02 13 6 5,033 0.1554 $ 0.3367 | $ 1,270.92
ARNOLD 100% WHOLE WHEAT SANDWICH THINS:
18| 8690 8/pkg., 120z. X PK 1862 8 7227 FREIHOFER | $ 2.20 12 8 1,862 0.18333/ $ 0.2750 | $ 512.05 42-10361 |MR. PITA $ 179 9.5 6 2,483 0.1884 $ 0.2983 |$  555.50
ARNOLD MULTI GRAIN SANDWICH THINS: 8/pkg.,
19| 8695 120z. PK 1597 8 7063 FREIHOFER | $ 2.20 12 8 1,597 0.18333/ $ 0.2750 | $ 439.18 42-10362 |MR. PITA $ 179 9.5 6 2,129 0.1884 $ 0.2983 |$  476.44
20| 8700 WHOLE GRAIN KAISER ROLL: sliced, 13 oz., 6 count. X PK 582 6 3244 FREIHOFER | $  1.50 13 6 582 0.11538/ $ 0.2500 | $ 145.50 27-666 PETRILLO'S $ 210 24 12 291 0.0875 $ 0.1750 | $ 101.85
MISCELLANEOUS
Whole
Grain
Rich or Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
BOCES 50% BOCES Product Total Vendor Vendor Price Product Total Vendor Vendor Price
Item Whole | Unitof | Estimated | Useable Code Vendor Vendor | Useable | Estimated | Vendor Price | per Useable Extended Bid Code Vendor Vendor | Useable | Estimated |Vendor Price| per Useable | Extended Bid
Number Item Description/Specification Grain | Measure | Quantities | Units Number | Product Brand Price  |Total Ozs.| units Quantity per Oz. Unit Cost Number | Product Brand Price  |Total Ozs.| units Quantity per Oz. Unit Cost
WHOLE GRAIN WHITE BREAD STICKS: 1loz. each, 8 FREIHOFER
21| 8705 count. Dz 669 12 7593 (is WGR) $ 225 19 12 669 0.11842/ $ 0.1875 | $ 125.44 97-5011 |BAKECRAFTERS | $ 32.81 240 240 33 0.1367| $ 0.1367 | $ 91.46
22| 8725 ENGLISH MUFFIN: white; 2 oz. dozen. Dz 13415 12 6322 FREIHOFER | $ 1.60 24 12 13,415 0.06667 | $ 0.1333 | $ 1,788.67 35-4350 |OAK RUN $ 176 24 12 13,415 0.0733' $ 0.1467 | $ 1,967.53
23| 8730 ENGLISH MUFFIN: wheat; 2 oz. dozen. X Dz 13928 12 7260 FREIHOFER | $ 2.60 26 12 13,928 0.10000 $ 0.2167 | $ 3,017.73 35-4360 |OAK RUN $ 1.96 24 12 13,928 0.0817 $ 0.1633 | $ 2,274.91
24| 8745 WRAP: Wheat 6", 12 ct. Father Sam's or equal. Dz 2315 12 NO BID 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 33-5053 |HARBAR $ 143 12 12 2,315 0.1192 $ 0.1192 | $  275.87
25/ 8755 WRAP: Whole Wheat 8", 12 ct, Father Sam's or equal. X Dz 2770 12 3389 FREIHOFER | $ 2.70 18 12 2,770 0.15000 $ 0.2250 | $ 623.25 32-22804 HARBAR $ 175 16 10 3,324 0.1094 $ 0.1750 | $  484.75
26/ 8765 WRAP: Whole Wheat 10", 12 ct, Father Sam's or equal. X Dz 3195 12 7737 FREIHOFER | $  3.00 42 12 3,195 0.07143/ $ 0.2500 | $ 798.75 33-50513 HARBAR $ 1.96 33 12 3,195 0.0594 $ 0.1633 |$ 521.85
SHEET PIZZA SHELL WHOLE WHEAT: sheet, 32 0z., 5
27| 8840 pk. X PK 2680 5 NO BID 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 27-999 PETRILLO'S | $ 16.76 5 2,680 #DIV/O! | $ 3.3520 | $ 8,983.36
SHEET PIZZA SHELL WHOLE WHEAT: 1/2 sheet, 16
28| 8845|0z., 5 pk. X PK 11793 5 NO BID 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 27-999 PETRILLO'S | $ 16.76 5 11,793| #DIV/O! | $ 3.3520 | $ 39,530.14
29| 8850 PITA BREAD: Wheat 8", 5 pack. X PK 833 5 NO BID 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 42-7 MR. PITA $ 147 5 833 #DIV/O! | $ 0.2940 | $  244.90
30 8865 PITA BREAD: Wheat 6", 10 ct. X PK 825 10 NO BID 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 17-358 FATHERSAM'S | $  4.47 17.5 10 825 0.2554 $ 0.4470 | $ 368.78
Total Bid Cost of Common Items $ 21,919.37| | $ 25,084.02




